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Grant Report

Coach Moore <mvnswimcoach@gmail.com> Mon, Aug 9, 2021 at 11:51 AM
To: Kris McPeak <ladypipes@gmail.com>

SPMS Finance Committee
The grant was used to offset the officials expense which was over $4,000.
Knowing our grant was approved additional funds were used to enhance the meet experience and success with swimmers

credentials, programs and additional paid staff.

Thank you
Coach Mark

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 9, 2021, at 10:55 AM, Kris McPeak <ladypipes@gmail.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]
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